From: Andrea Ramsey

To: Georgia Kofoed

Subject: Re: Your invoice: INV-7954
Date: Friday, May 3, 2024 10:36:12 AM
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Georgia,

We installed the signs this morning. I am compiling the pictures to be emailed off at the end. I
have attached a copy of the affidavit here. And a snapshot of the installation pictures from
today.

[Installation May 3rd
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Thank you,
Andrea R.

Client Account Specialist

1110 Elkton Drive

Suite |

Colorado Springs, CO 80907
Hours Monday-Friday 830-4

To Pay via card use this link:
https://securepayment.link/signaramacoloradospringsnorth/

719-574-9400
info@coloradosignarama.com
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Affidavit for Notice of Public Hearing

l, the undersigned, hereby confirm that the property, or properties, associated with File No(s).:

\JRALA will be posted with
Notice of Public Hearing signage in the location(s) and by the date depicted on the vicinity map
provided by the Planning and Community Development Department. The notice will be in a
conspicuous location so it is clearly visible to the public.

By signing this affidavit, | confirm that the sign(s) will remain posted until after the date of the
specified hearings. If the sign(s) are damaged so that it is no longer legible or if the sign(s) are
removed, | will notify the Planning and Community Development Department as soon as possible
for a replacement. | also understand that the signage is property of El Paso County, Colorado,
and anyone defacing or removing the sign without authority will be prosecuted to the full extent
of the law.

, the undersigned, agree to email photograph(s) of the sign(s) posted on the subject property
Kas proof of posting to PCDHearings@elpasoco.com within 24 hours of physically posting to the
subject property. | understand that failure to post the sign(s), email proof of posting, and/or
repost if the poster is removed or rendered illegible may result in rescheduling hearing dates.

l ff (¢ (DosS5as a , state that the foregoing facts and
contents of this affidavit is true anfl correct to the best of m\g/y edge, information, and belief.

Aﬂ/? P

/pﬁ’rcan{ signature /
State of Colorado (

County of‘ EL pAé()
Signed before me on M AY' j— il 20 ZAL
oy MARCELLA VW ES

(Name of individual making statement).

A el \4!\/\(\&/0)

MARCELLA MAES
(Not)lry s official SIgnature NOTARY PUBLIC
STATE OF COLORADO
NOTARY ID 20224025634
MY COMMISSION EXPIRES JUNE 30, 2026
(Tltle of offlce)

Jule 2D 207

(Commission Explratloﬂ)
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On Thu, May 2, 2024 at 10:17 AM Georgia Kofoed <georgia@ldcaz.com> wrote:
Hi-

Thank you for getting this done.
Please also send a copy of the affidavit for our files.
Have a great day!

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone
Get Outlook for Android

From: Signarama of Colorado Springs <info@coloradosignarama.com>
Sent: Thursday, May 2, 2024 8:58:24 AM

To: Georgia Kofoed <georgia@I|dcaz.com>
Subject: Your invoice: INV-7954

Georgia,
We got the posters at the end of the day yesterday. They want them in 4 locations. I have the
invoice here. We will put them out tomorrow, check them twice and remove after the 13th.

The pictures will be sent to the email provided by El Paso county and a copy to you as well.
Your invoice with invoice number: INV-7954 is attached.

Please feel free to contact us if you have any additional questions.

Thanks,
Signarama of Colorado Springs

If you wish to pay online use the following link:
https://securepayment.link/signaramacoloradospringsnorth/
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