Ann Odom

From: Joe Goode <jgoode@entechengineers.com>
Sent: Monday, September 9, 2024 12:21 PM

To: Ann Odom

Subject: Fw: Thank you for your payment

Ann see payment receipt below

Thanks
Joe Goode, PE

ENTECH

ENGINEERING, INC.

Entech Engineering, Inc.
505 Elkton Dr.

Colorado Springs, CO 80907
Office: 719-5631-5599

From: CGS_LUR@mines.edu <CGS_LUR@mines.edu>
Sent: Monday, September 9, 2024 12:15 PM

To: Joe Goode <jgoode@entechengineers.com>
Subject: Thank you for your payment

Receipt Number: 866632
Colorado Geological Survey
Date: 09/09/2024

Description Amount
Pre-Pay the Colorado Geological Survey Land Use $950.00
Review Fee

Must select project size to calculate a price: Small

Subdivision -

Project Name: Lazy Y & Rockin J Subdivision
County of Project: El Paso

Applicant's Name: NES

Applicant's Address (line 1): 619 N Cascade, Suite
200

Applicant's City: Colorado Springs

Applicant's State: CO

Applicant's Zip Code: 80903

Applicant's Phone: 7197410073

Applicant's Email: jgoode@entechengineers.com
Pre-Pay the Colorado Geological Survey Land Use
Review Fee

Total $950.00



Payments Received

CC
Discover XXXXXXXXXXXX4014
Authorization # 00996P

Thank you for the payment.

Total

Amount

$950.00

$950.00



