7/12/23, 5:11 PM MS Civil Mail - Woodmen Road District Fees

M Gma i| Georgianne Willard <georgiannew@mscivil.com>

Woodmen Road District Fees

Rebecca Harris <rebecca.h@wsdistricts.co> Wed, Jul 12, 2023 at 4:54 PM
To: Georgianne Willard <georgiannew@mescivil.com>

This plat was previously paid, no payment is due @

Thank you!

Rebecca Harris
District Manager

Vice President of District Services

DISTRICT MANAGERS

614 N. Tejon St.
Colorado Springs, CO 80903
Office: (719) 447-1777 ext: 103

Direct: (719)_266-3189
Email: rebecca.h@wsdistricts.co

Website: www.WSDistricts.co

PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL
This communication and any accompanying documents are confidential and privileged. They are intended for the sole use of the addressee. If you receive this transmission in error, you are advised that

any disclosure, copying, distribution, or the taking of any action in reliance upon this communication is strictly prohibited. Moreover, any such disclosure shall not compromise or waive any privileges. If
you have received this communication in error, please contact me at the above email address.
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7/12/23, 5:11 PM MS Civil Mail - Woodmen Road District Fees

From: Georgianne Willard <georgiannew@mscivil.com>
Sent: Wednesday, July 12, 2023 12:51 PM

To: Rebecca Harris <rebecca.h@wsdistricts.co>
Subject: Re: Woodmen Road District Fees

Hi Rebecca, this is Bent Grass East Commercial Fil No. 4, a replat of Lot 1A of Bent Grass East Commercial 2A.

| have included a PDF in this email. Would the fees have been paid with 2A?

On Wed, Jul 12, 2023 at 12:23 PM Rebecca Harris <rebecca.h@wsdistricts.co> wrote:

Hey Georgianne,

| am researching this right now to see if | can find something. | see plats paid for the below but no plat paid for just “Bent Grass East Commercial”’. Which filing is
Filing 4 a re-plat of?

Bent Grass East Commercial Filing 1
Bent Grass East Commercial Filing 2
Bent Grass East Commercial Filing 2B
Bent Grass East Commercial Filing 3

Thank you!

Rebecca Harris

District Manager

Vice President of District Services
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